Purchasing Department

Madison County Board of Supervisors 146 West Center Street Canton, Mississippi 39046

601-855-5503 hardy@madison-co.com

7 March 2017

District I Supe	rvisor Shella Jones
District 2 Supe	rvisor Trey Baxter
District 3 Supe	rvisor Gerald Steen
District 4 Supe	rvisor David Bishop

District 5 Supervisor Paul Griffin

Subject: Award Asphalt Term Bids for Period 1 April 2017 – 30 September 2017

Dear Board Members:

Attached is the bid tabulation and copies of the recently-opened term bids for asphalt products and services for the six-month period 1 April 2017 - 30 September 2017.

A few bits of good news:

- The price of SC 1 Type II surface asphalt price only increased 40 cents per ton, from \$49.50 to \$49.90.
- The price of liquid asphalt dropped 11 cents per gallon, from \$1.44 to \$1.33.
- The turnkey price for furnishing, hauling, and laying down SC1 Type II surface asphalt remained steady at \$73.85 per ton.

I recommend that the Board take the following action:

Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017
 - 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton's price for SC-1 of \$49.90 is higher than APAC-Jackson's bid; however, the round-trip haul distance from APAC-Jackson's plants is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of SC 1 Type II Asphalt from APAC-Canton is \$50.16 compared to \$53.14 from the next lowest bidder, APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid."

- 2. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPAHLT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Jackson.
- 3. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPAHLT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to D&B.

4. Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 – 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton's bid for SC-1 Type 8 of \$54 is higher than D&B's bid of \$51 and ADCAMP's bid of \$53; however, the round-trip haul distances to D&B and ADCAMP are greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is \$54.26 compared to \$55.23 from D&B and \$57.76 from ADACAMP, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid." Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

- 5. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPAHLT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to D&B.
- 6. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.
- 7. Award the Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton's bid for BB-1 Asphalt of \$48 is higher than D&B's and APAC-Jackson's bids; however, the round-trip haul distances to D&B and APAC-Jackson areas are much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of BB-1 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is \$48.26 compared to \$49.05 from D&B and \$51.29 from APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid." Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

- 8. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to D&B.
- 9. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Jackson.
- 10. Award the Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ERGON.
- 11. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to Blackledge.
- 12. Award the Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to Dickerson & Bowen.
- 13. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Jackson.
- 14. Award the Term Bid for ROAD RECLAMATION (all depths) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.

- 15. Award the Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS (all depths) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.
- 16. Award the Term Bid for COLD MILLING for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.
- 17. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MILLING for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Canton.
- 18. Award the Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT (county selects and pays asphalt vendor) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.
- 19. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT (county selects and pays asphalt vendor) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Canton.
- 20. Award the Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING ASPHALT (turnkey price; vendor provides asphalt) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to ADCAMP.
- 21. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING ASPHALT (turnkey price; vendor provides asphalt) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to D&B.
- 22. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING ASPHALT (turnkey price; vendor provides asphalt) for the period 1 April 2017 30 Sept 2017 to APAC-Canton.

Sincerely.

Purchase Clerk

ASPHALT TABULATION FOR 1 APRIL 2017 TO 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

FIRST ALTERNATE TERM BID
2ND ALTERNATE TERM BID

Terry May
O: 376-4000
F: 376-4055

Terry May O: 376-4000 F: 376-4055 Don Gleen O: 346-7368 F: 346-7152

Ralph Barnes O: 939-4493 C: 940-1343

john.may@apac.com

dongleen@ bellsouth.net

adcampinc.com

ralph@

SC 1 TYPE II PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT

Miles to Road Department
SC 1 Type II Asphalt
Round Trip Miles
X \$1.19 Per Mile Freight Cost
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up
Cost per ton picked-up

APAC Canton	APAC Jackson	Dickerson Jackson	ADCAMP Rankin
1.5	28.2	23.8	28
\$49.90	\$48.35	\$50.00	\$52.00
3	56.4	47.6	56
\$3.57	\$67.12	\$56.64	\$66.64
\$0.26	\$4.79	\$4.05	\$4.76
\$50.16	\$53.14	\$54.05	\$56.76

SC 1 TYPE 8 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT

Miles to Road Department
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt
Round Trip Miles
X \$1.19 Per Mile Freight Cost
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up
Cost per ton picked-up

1	APAC	APAC	Dickerson	ADCAMP
ı	Canton	Jackson	Jackson	Rankin
Ì	1.5	28.2	24.9	28
ı	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$51.00	\$53.00
	3	56.4	49.8	56
	\$3.57	\$67.12	\$59.26	\$66.64
	\$0.26	\$4.79	\$4.23	\$4.76
	\$54.26	\$58.79	\$55.23	\$57.76

BB 1 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT

Miles to Road Department

BB 1 ASPHALT

Round Trip Miles

X \$1.19 Per Mile Freight Cost

Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up

Cost per ton picked-up

APAC	APAC	Dickerson	ADCAMP
Canton	Jackson	Jackson	Rankin
1.5	28.2	24.9	28
\$48.00	\$46.50	\$45.00	\$52.00
3	56.4	47.6	56
\$3.57	\$67.12	\$56.64	\$66.64
\$0.26	\$4.79	\$4.05	\$4.76
\$48.26	\$51.29	\$49.05	\$56.76

COLD MIX

APAC	Dickerson
JACKSON	JACKSON
\$119.00	\$95.00

HAULING & LAYING ASPHALT COUNTY SELECTS & PAYS ASPAHLT VENDOR

LAYING HAULING APAC
Canton
\$13.20
.29 per T/M
300 T Minimum

ADCAMP Rankin \$11.65 .25 per T/M

FURNISHING, HAULING, & LAYING ASPHALT TURNKEY PRICE; CONTRACTOR PROVIDES ASPHALT

Hauling Surchage greater tha 40 miles

ADCAMP APAC CANTON \$73.85 \$82.00 0.25 0.29

Dickerson Jackson \$80.00

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD

ADCAMP \$3

APAC Canton \$4.00 500 sq yd min

LIQUID ASPHALT CRS-2

ERGON \$1.33

228-863-3878 BLACKLEDGE \$1.42

ROAD RECLAMATION

4 Inches 8 Inches 12 Inches 18 Inches 24 Inches ADCAMP \$40.00 \$45.00 \$50.00 \$60.00 \$70.00

ADCAMP APAC-C Dickerson \$65.00 \$130.00

ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD
ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD

\$65.00 \$150.00

\$150

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

	SC 1 Type II Asphalt	\$ 4990	per ton
	SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	#5400	_ per ton
	BB 1 Asphalt	4800	_per ton
	Cold Mix	-NA-	per ton
The	CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCL LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. N above maderial is FUB APAC'S	O FRACTIONS OF	PARTIES TO CONTRACTOR OF THE C

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant, and laydown by contractor.

Turn-Key Price

Hauling surcharge for distances greater than 40 miles

29/w per ton-mile

Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)

The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)" is for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from county's designated asphalt vendor(s), hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by contractor. Haul mileage will be paid for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling

Laying

29/xy/3 mmis per ton-mile

13.72 per ton 300 Ton minimum

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt			
Per Square Yard 68	per sy	mmi 75 5 4 4 5.	
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24	inches and repla	ce with base asphalt	
Per Square Yard	VA -		
COLD MILLING (ALL DEP Per Square Yard	350	500 sy minmur	
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)			
4 (four) inch depth	MA	per square yard	
8 (eight) inch depth	NA	per square yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	NA	per square yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth	NA	_per square yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	NA	per square yard	
	W 1961	,	
For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department:Miles			

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississipp', Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
Jackson, lls 39225-4508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-954-8766
FAX NUMBER: 601-396-4085
EMAIL: john. May@apac. Com
(Lun May 2-14-19)
AUTHORIZED REFRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
Terry May
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt	\$48 ³⁵ per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	#54, 50 per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	46 per ton
Cold Mix	#/1900 per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDING TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. No The above material is FUB APAC'S	O FRACTIONS OF A CENT

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), <u>hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant</u>, and laydown by contractor.

Turn-Key Price	NA	per ton
Hauling surcharge for distances greater t	han 40 miles	
	NA	per ton-mile

Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)

The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)" is for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from county's designated asphalt vendor(s), hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by contractor. Haul mileage will be paid for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling		29/xy /3-minmons Apper ton-mile	
Laying	** a	$-\mathcal{N}A^-$ per ton	

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inc	ches and replace w	rith base asphalt	
Per Square Yard	X/A		
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24	inches and replac	ce with base asphalt	
Per Square Yard	MA		
*			
COLD MILLING (ALL DEF	PTHS)		
Per Square Yard	NA		
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pa	y Item will be pr	e square yard)	
4 (four) inch depth	NA	per square yard	
8 (eight) inch depth		_per square yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	-	_per square yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth		_per square yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	NA	_per square yard	
¥			
For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department:			

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-954-8766
FAX NUMBER: 601-376-4055
EMAIL: john. May @ apac. com
Veryllan 2-14-19
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt	\$52.00	_ per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	\$53.00	per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	\$52.00	per ton
Cold Mix	NO BID	per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCL	NO BID LUDED IN BID PE	per gallon RICE. BID PRICE DF A CENT.

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), <u>hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant</u>, and laydown by contractor.

\$73.85	per ton
ater than 40 miles	
\$0.25	per ton-mile
	ater than 40 miles

Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)

The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)" is for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from county's designated asphalt vendor(s), hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by contractor. Haul mileage will be paid for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling	\$0.25 \$3.75 HAUL M	per ton-mile
Laying	\$11.65	per ton

RC	AT) B.	ASE	REP	AIRS
----	----	------	-----	-----	------

NOAD BROL RETTING			
Dig out road to depth of 10 inches	s and replace w	vith base asphalt	
Per Square Yard\$65.00			
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 in Per Square Yard \$150.00	6	ce with base asphalt	
COLD MILLING (ALL DEPT	HS)		
Per Square Yard \$3.00			
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard) \$40.00 per square yard			
4 (four) inch depth	1	per square yard	
8 (eight) inch depth	\$45.00	per square yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	\$50.00	per square yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth	\$60.00	per square yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	\$70.00	per square yard	
For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department:Miles			

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:_	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS: (MAILING) P. O. BOX 54246, JACKSON, MS 39	288
(PHYSICA	L) 1353 FLOWOOD DRIVE, FLOWOOD, M	IS 39232
TELEPHONE: 601-	939–4493	
CELL PHONE NUME	BER:601-940-1343 (RALPH BARNES	3)
FAX NUMBER: 6	01-939-4676	
EMAIL: RALPH@ADCAM	PINC.COM	A
AUTHORIZED REPR	RESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	03/07/2017 DATE
DAIDU BADNEC DRE	SIDENT	Tegala san

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Aspnan	30 %	_ per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	5/00	_ per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	64500	_ per ton
Cold Mix	\$9500	_ per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUMITED TO DOLL ARS AND CENTS ONLY.	LUDED IN BID PRIC	(i) \$10,000,000,000

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), <u>hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant</u>, and laydown by contractor.

Turn-Key Price	8000	per ton	
Hauling surcharge for distances greater th	an 40 miles		
	0.25	per ton-mile	
Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selec	ts and pays asph	alt vendor)	
The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (county selects and pays asphalt vendor)" is for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.			
Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from county's designated asphalt vendor(s), hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by contractor. Haul mileage will be paid for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).			
Hauling	No Bid	per ton-mile	
Laying	No Bid	per ton	

ROAD BASE REPAIRS			
Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt			
Per Square Yard	<u> </u>		
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24	inches and replace with base asphalt		
Per Square Yard	50.99		
COLD MILLING (ALL DEP	ГНЅ)		
Per Square Yard	Bid		
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)			
4 (four) inch depth	No Brd per square yard		
8 (eight) inch depth	per square yard		
12 (twelve) inch depth	No Bid per square yard		
18 (eighteen) inch depth	No Bid per square yard		
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	No Bid per square yard		

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant to the Madison County

Miles

Road Department: 23.8

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & Bouses 2nc.	
ADDRESS: P.O. Bay 1008	
Bruskhaves, Ms. 39602	
TELEPHONE: (601) 969-2002	
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601) 540-5005	÷-
FAX NUMBER: (601) 969-2004	
EMAIL: donglenne bellsouthingt	
Shi 3/1/1	16
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATI	Ε
Dos G. Glas Avea manner	-

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt	NO BID	_per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	NO BID	_per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	NO BID	_per ton
Cold Mix	NO BID	_per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLU LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. <u>N</u> O		

Pricing is based on delivery of full truck transport quantities.

Demurrage: 2 hours free; \$75/hr thereafter. Federal Environmental Fee: \$0.00150/gal.

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), <u>hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant</u>, and laydown by contractor.

laydown by contractor.		
Turn-Key Price	N/A	per ton
Hauling surcharge for distances greater th	nan 40 miles	•
44	N/A	per ton-mile
Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selec	ts and pays as	phalt vendor)
The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (county for road overlay projects to be determined by the couronad construction projects in which a contractor is put as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road con	anty. It does not a archasing, hauling	pply to advertised g, and laying asphal
Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from count hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by co for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).	ntractor. Haul mi	leage will be paid
Hauling	N/A	per ton-mile
Laving	N/A	per ton

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Per Square Yard N/	A	
Dig out road to depth of 11 -2	4 inches and repl	ace with base asphalt
Per Square YardN	//A	
COLD MILLING (ALL DE	PTHS)	
Per Square Yard	N/A	
		8
ROAD RECLAMATION (P	ay Item will be j	pre square yard)
4 (four) inch depth	N/A	per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth	N/A	per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth	N/A	per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth	N/A	per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	N/A	per square yard
9		
For use in our calculation of Number of Miles from Your Road Department:approxima	Company Plant	

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC	•
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 23028	
-	JACKSON, MS 39225-3028	
TELEPHONE:	601-933-3000	
CELL PHONE NUMBER: _	601-497-7278	ু <u>। । । । । । । । । । । । । । । । । । ।</u>
FAX NUMBER:	601-933-3363	
EMAIL:	amy.walker@ergon.com	
Aus Walker		March 7, 2017
AUTHORIZED REPRESEN	TATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
Amy Walker, Area Sales Manager		

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. 12251 Bernard Parkway Suite 200 Gulfport, MS 39503

t. 800-866-3878 blacklidgeemulsions.com

February 27, 2017

Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office Madson County Chancery Courthouse Rooms 225-227, Second Floor 146 West Center Street Canton, MS 39046

RE: Liquid Asphalt Bid CRS-2

To Whom It May Concern,

Please find enclosed the bid specification response for liquid asphalt from Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. Above bid is due on March 7, 2017.

Let us know if we need to provide you with any other documentation. We look forward to working with you in the future.

Thank you,

Jen Myers

Governmental Accounts Manager

Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.

M VMMW

228-863-3878 (O)

228-864-0437 (F)

228-224-0885 (C)

imyers@be-inc.com

Enclosures

**** Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. is an equal opportunity employer****

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2017 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 7 MARCH 2017

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt		_ per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt (Per 1990 MDOT specifications)	N etc.	_ per ton
BB 1 Asphalt		_ per ton
Cold Mix		_per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLU		

The term bid "Furnishing, Hauling & Laying of Asphalt" is a turn-key term bid for road overlay projects to be determined by the county. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

This is a turn-key price that shall include contractor-furnishing SC 1 Type II Asphalt (or equivalent), <u>hauling asphalt for up to 40 miles from contractor's asphalt plant</u>, and laydown by contractor.

Turn-Key Price	per ton
Hauling surcharge for distances greater t	han 40 miles
	per ton-mile
Hauling and Laying Asphalt (county selection)	cts and pays asphalt vendor)
The term bid "Hauling & Laying of Asphalt (count for road overlay projects to be determined by the coroad construction projects in which a contractor is past of a board-awarded bid for a specific road contractor."	y selects and pays asphalt vendor)" is bunty. It does not apply to advertised burchasing, hauling, and laying asphal
Asphalt shall be picked-up by contractor from coun hauled to job site by contractor, and laid-down by c for the distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).	contractor. Haul mileage will be paid
Hauling	per ton-mile
Laving	per ton

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 incl	nes and replace with base asphalt	
Per Square Yard		
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 Per Square Yard	inches and replace with base asphalt	
COLD MILLING (ALL DEP	THS)	
Per Square Yard		
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)		
4 (four) inch depth	per square yard	
8 (eight) inch depth	per square yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	per square yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth	per square yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	per square yard	
For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department: Miles		

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.
ADDRESS: 12251 Bernard Parkway Suite 200
Gulfport, MS 79503
TELEPHONE: 116.843.3878
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 228 · 224 · 0885
FAX NUMBER: 228.864.0437
EMAIL: Myers @ be-inc.com
EMAIL: JMyers @ be-inc.com 2211
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
DDINITED ALITHODIZED DEDDECENTATIVE ON ME HEDE

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

ESTIMATE OF COST PER MILE TO OPERATE DUMP TRUCKS FOR THE PERIOD 1 OCTOBER 2016 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2017

AVERAGE MPG FOR DUMP TRUCK	5.28
DIESEL PRICE PER GALLON	\$1.68
DIESEL COST PER MILE	\$0.32
OTHER COSTS PER MILE (TIRES, REPAIRS, ETC)	\$0.18
TOTAL TRUCK COST PER MILE	\$0.50
AVERAGE DRIVER WAGES & BENEFITS	\$20.88
AVERAGE MILES DRIVEN PER HOUR	30
DRIVER COST PER MILE	\$0.70
ESTIMATED COST PER MILE	\$1.19

Notes: Diesel price is based on most recent Fuelman bill

Driver wages and benefits cost courtesy of Human Resources Director
Other Costs is based on purchase orders for tires, parts, and repairs